
Base Bid 
Item

LOCATION Normal                                                              Weekend Rush Normal Demand Normal Weekend Rush Normal Demand Normal Weekend Rush Normal Demand

1 Hutto Central WWTP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $57,792.48 $103,317.60 $70,785.48 $5,260.32 $9,788.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Hutto South WWTP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68,192.42 $168,104.42 $83,786.09 $50.58 $94.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Temple-Belton WWTP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $100,871.55 $209,471.55 $131,059.41 $24,764.48 $39,399.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Doshier Farm WWTP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $92,349.52 $212,591.44 $114,711.48 $5,252.52 $30,953.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Sugar Land North WWTP $40,355.00 $40,355.00 $44,175.00 $0.00 $0.00 $57,445.30 $151,275.70 $70,837.52 $19,897.80 $46,924.80 $38,762.00 $41,652.00 $43,944.00 $3,120.00 $5,460.00
6 Sugar Land South WWTP $48,785.00 $48,785.00 $57,045.00 $0.00 $0.00 $75,523.46 $167,616.26 $93,435.66 $19,897.80 $46,924.80 $48,906.00 $55,886.00 $57,104.00 $3,120.00 $5,460.00
7 Sugar Land South Reuse Plant $8,580.00 $8,580.00 $7,020.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9,574.24 $45,716.32 $11,968.32 $127.55 $300.80 $7,488.00 $11,336.00 $7,488.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 Sugar Land Greatwood WWTP $31,670.00 $31,670.00 $40,620.00 $0.00 $0.00 $55,865.48 $94,787.72 $68,376.92 $127.55 $300.80 $35,212.00 $36,768.00 $39,860.00 $20.00 $35.00
9 Sugar Land New Territory WWTP $24,650.00 $24,650.00 $30,090.00 $0.00 $0.00 $40,496.88 $79,419.12 $49,651.20 $127.55 $300.80 $25,956.00 $27,512.00 $29,824.00 $20.00 $35.00
10 Clute-Richwood WWTP $18,770.00 $18,770.00 $20,415.00 $0.00 $0.00 $27,405.02 $64,589.66 $33,771.62 $7,280.00 $32,786.00 $18,078.00 $19,282.00 $20,788.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00

$172,810.00 $172,810.00 $199,365.00 $0.00 $0.00 $585,516.35 $1,296,889.79 $728,383.70 $82,786.15 $207,773.48 $174,402.00 $192,436.00 $199,008.00 $7,580.00 $13,590.00

CUMULATIVE BID:

Aqua-Tech (4 onlyl) plus Eastex $2,073,581.82
savings over Aqua-Tech (all) $827,767.65

Aqua-Tech (4 onlyl) plus Envirodyne $2,115,612.82
savings over Aqua-Tech (all) $785,736.65

Bid Tabulation
LABORATORY ANALYTICAL SERVICES
RFB No. 24-1326

RESPONDENT

$2,901,349.47 $587,016.00

BID
Unit Cost TAT x Estimated Annual Samples

PICKUP FEES                                                 
Fee x Pickup Frequency

EASTEX LABS

$544,985.00

BID
Unit Cost TAT x Estimated Annual Samples

ENVIRODYNE LABS

BID
Unit Cost TAT x Estimated Annual Samples

PICKUP FEES                                                 
Fee x Pickup Frequency

PICKUP FEES                                                 
Fee x Pickup Frequency

AQUA-TECH


